
ITEM# ASSESSMENT# STATUS SALE PRICE

1 010591740-5 OFF SALE

2 010592987-5 SOLD $2,890.00

3 010594084-5 REDEEMED

4 010594115-0 REDEEMED

5 010594551-0 REDEEMED

6 010594595-0 SOLD $400.00

7 010594845-6 REDEEMED

8 010596445-4 SOLD $500.00

9 010599112-2 SOLD $400.00

10 010631902-8 REDEEMED

11 010632255-0 REDEEMED

12 010632256-1 REDEEMED

13 010632438-9 SOLD $400.00

14 010636435-8 REDEEMED

15 010636695-6 REDEEMED

16 010636758-0 SOLD $3,007.00

17 010636839-0 REDEEMED

18 010636966-1 REDEEMED

19 010638783-8 NO BID

20 010639797-4 NO BID

21 010640250-0 NO BID

22 010640756-1 SOLD $800.00

23 010640782-4 NO BID

24 010640946-6 NO BID

25 010641008-2 NO BID

26 010641147-4 REDEEMED

27 010650553-5 SOLD $3,262.00

28 010653209-4 REDEEMED

29 010655856-4 SOLD $3,091.00

30 010656435-0 SOLD $3,007.00

31 010661380-9 REDEEMED

32 010661393-1 SOLD $2,862.00

33 010661619-6 SOLD $2,527.00

34 010662327-5 SOLD $3,007.00

35 010690023-7 REDEEMED

36 010690848-6 REDEEMED

37 010690849-7 SOLD $3,729.00

38 010692569-0 REDEEMED

39 010694458-9 REDEEMED

40 010695580-8 NO BID

41 010695617-9 INCOMPLETE $400.00

42 010695669-6 REDEEMED

43 010695754-9 NO BID

44 010697911-0 SOLD $400.00

45 010697932-9 REDEEMED

46 010700204-4 NO BID
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47 010700225-3 REDEEMED

48 010700627-3 REDEEMED

49 010700753-3 REDEEMED

50 010701087-8 REDEEMED

51 010701330-7 NO BID

52 010701843-4 SOLD $800.00

53 010702095-8 NO BID

54 010702329-0 NO BID

55 010702651-0 REDEEMED

56 010702878-9 REDEEMED

57 010702959-9 REDEEMED

58 010704180-7 REDEEMED

59 010704481-9 NO BID

60 010710289-2 REDEEMED

61 010710574-9 NO BID

62 010710625-2 REDEEMED

63 010710917-6 SOLD $800.00

64 010710923-1 NO BID

65 010711129-4 NO BID

66 010711301-2 REDEEMED

67 010711308-9 NO BID

68 010711800-6 NO BID

69 010712406-7 OFF SALE

70 010712630-2 REDEEMED

71 010712666-5 REDEEMED

72 010712935-8 NO BID

73 010713177-3 NO BID

74 010713320-5 REDEEMED

75 010713416-9 REDEEMED

76 010713521-0 REDEEMED

77 010713542-9 NO BID

78 010713920-7 NO BID

79 010714261-8 NO BID

80 010714313-2 NO BID

81 010714489-8 SOLD $800.00

82 010714917-8 REDEEMED

83 010715691-6 REDEEMED

84 010715692-7 REDEEMED

85 010715739-7 SOLD $800.00

86 010715740-7 NO BID

87 010716029-2 REDEEMED

88 010716715-8 REDEEMED

89 010716927-3 NO BID

90 010717372-4 NO BID

91 010717608-8 NO BID

92 010720183-0 REDEEMED
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93 010720221-1 NO BID

94 010720223-3 REDEEMED

95 010720375-7 NO BID

96 010720710-6 NO BID

97 010720975-9 NO BID

98 010721293-9 REDEEMED

99 010721373-8 REDEEMED

100 010721690-4 REDEEMED

101 010721967-5 NO BID

102 010722221-7 NO BID

103 010722238-3 NO BID

104 010722247-1 NO BID

105 010722295-4 REDEEMED

106 010722315-9 REDEEMED

107 010722439-8 NO BID

108 010722443-1 REDEEMED

109 010722870-3 REDEEMED

110 010723128-0 NO BID

111 010723245-2 NO BID

112 010723275-9 REDEEMED

113 010732572-5 SOLD $2,814.00

114 010732691-9 SOLD $2,915.00

115 010733591-5 SOLD $2,718.00

116 010736144-4 REDEEMED

117 010736180-6 SOLD $2,580.00

118 010737150-2 REDEEMED

119 010737274-1 SOLD $2,814.00

120 010738217-3 NO BID

121 010738490-2 REDEEMED

122 010738881-2 REDEEMED

123 010750703-3 REDEEMED

124 010751804-4 NO BID

125 010751834-1 NO BID

126 010751985-4 REDEEMED

127 010752468-7 NO BID

128 010754363-1 REDEEMED

129 010754386-2 REDEEMED

130 010756201-4 REDEEMED

131 010758160-6 REDEEMED

132 010758161-7 REDEEMED

133 010758163-9 REDEEMED

134 010758647-0 REDEEMED

135 010760083-7 REDEEMED
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