

COUNTY OF RIVERSIDE
OFFICE OF THE TREASURER-TAX COLLECTOR
SALE OF TAX DEFAULTED PROPERTY - TC211
NOVEMBER 29, 2017

| <u>ITEM#</u> | <u>ASSESSMENT#</u> | <u>STATUS</u> | <u>SALE PRICE</u> |
|--------------|--------------------|---------------|-------------------|
| 1 | 135204006-1 | REDEEMED | |
| 2 | 149200008-2 | SOLD | \$5,786.80 |
| 3 | 175220010-6 | SOLD | \$25,010.90 |
| 4 | 183310007-1 | SOLD | \$449.45 |
| 5 | 239100008-1 | SOLD | \$519.49 |
| 6 | 256160010-3 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 7 | 266320013-3 | SOLD | \$3,746.60 |
| 8 | 269140011-6 | SOLD | \$1,101.65 |
| 9 | 271080009-7 | NO BID | |
| 10 | 271181042-8 | SOLD | \$1,308.30 |
| 11 | 271252003-2 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 12 | 273230008-3 | SOLD | \$751.10 |
| 13 | 277044027-3 | SOLD | \$6,542.00 |
| 14 | 282090051-5 | SOLD | \$2,001.00 |
| 15 | 282090052-6 | SOLD | \$501.00 |
| 16 | 287060037-5 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 17 | 313020006-5 | SOLD | \$501.00 |
| 18 | 320360012-3 | OFF SALE | |
| 19 | 333112018-6 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 20 | 365030008-7 | SOLD | \$400.00 |
| 21 | 365030009-8 | SOLD | \$400.00 |
| 22 | 365030014-2 | SOLD | \$400.00 |
| 23 | 365270082-5 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 24 | 366120046-6 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 25 | 366130044-5 | SOLD | \$5,000.45 |
| 26 | 375021013-6 | SOLD | \$3,011.00 |
| 27 | 375021016-9 | SOLD | \$327.00 |
| 28 | 375032005-3 | SOLD | \$3,246.15 |
| 29 | 375032012-9 | SOLD | \$1,501.10 |
| 30 | 375033012-2 | SOLD | \$305.00 |
| 31 | 375034010-3 | SOLD | \$501.00 |
| 32 | 375061008-6 | SOLD | \$1,547.80 |
| 33 | 375061012-9 | SOLD | \$505.00 |
| 34 | 375071008-7 | SOLD | \$1,000.00 |
| 35 | 375121017-9 | SOLD | \$299.45 |
| 36 | 375131053-2 | SOLD | \$1,000.00 |
| 37 | 375131055-4 | SOLD | \$999.45 |
| 38 | 375153044-2 | SOLD | \$551.95 |
| 39 | 375201023-1 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 40 | 375203009-5 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 41 | 375231049-8 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 42 | 375232042-4 | SOLD | \$351.00 |
| 43 | 375263011-2 | REDEEMED | |
| 44 | 375263015-6 | SOLD | \$501.00 |
| 45 | 375282031-9 | SOLD | \$251.00 |

COUNTY OF RIVERSIDE
OFFICE OF THE TREASURER-TAX COLLECTOR
SALE OF TAX DEFAULTED PROPERTY - TC211
NOVEMBER 29, 2017

| <u>ITEM#</u> | <u>ASSESSMENT#</u> | <u>STATUS</u> | <u>SALE PRICE</u> |
|--------------|--------------------|---------------|-------------------|
| 46 | 375342006-2 | SOLD | \$503.00 |
| 47 | 375371020-4 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 48 | 378054012-8 | REDEEMED | |
| 49 | 378054024-9 | SOLD | \$2,001.65 |
| 50 | 378054035-9 | SOLD | \$2,502.20 |
| 51 | 378054045-8 | SOLD | \$305.00 |
| 52 | 378055003-3 | SOLD | \$305.00 |
| 53 | 378055028-6 | SOLD | \$500.00 |
| 54 | 378063015-9 | SOLD | \$251.00 |
| 55 | 378063018-2 | SOLD | \$305.00 |
| 56 | 378063029-2 | NO BID | |
| 57 | 378064037-2 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 58 | 378064041-5 | SOLD | \$1,501.10 |
| 59 | 378082009-3 | SOLD | \$499.45 |
| 60 | 378090030-6 | SOLD | \$3,200.00 |
| 61 | 378114041-9 | SOLD | \$500.90 |
| 62 | 378144009-4 | SOLD | \$550.00 |
| 63 | 378156022-2 | SOLD | \$1,501.10 |
| 64 | 378156043-1 | SOLD | \$2,000.00 |
| 65 | 378162009-0 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 66 | 378162021-0 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 67 | 378172040-8 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 68 | 378181066-0 | SOLD | \$520.00 |
| 69 | 378221031-1 | SOLD | \$1,248.35 |
| 70 | 378222005-1 | SOLD | \$1,006.46 |
| 71 | 378222006-2 | SOLD | \$6,187.66 |
| 72 | 378223029-6 | SOLD | \$550.45 |
| 73 | 378234003-6 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 74 | 378263010-2 | SOLD | \$4,989.00 |
| 75 | 378303024-8 | SOLD | \$1,000.55 |
| 76 | 378330028-6 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 77 | 382070027-3 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 78 | 407130019-3 | SOLD | \$550.00 |
| 79 | 407350029-2 | REDEEMED | |
| 80 | 413100015-1 | SOLD | \$1,001.00 |
| 81 | 414052011-6 | SOLD | \$1,249.45 |
| 82 | 432170025-6 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 83 | 434282006-9 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 84 | 481171050-9 | SOLD | \$25,134.24 |
| 85 | 481270059-4 | SOLD | \$2,010.00 |
| 86 | 482020043-3 | SOLD | \$748.90 |
| 87 | 513330003-2 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 88 | 516060038-1 | SOLD | \$300.00 |
| 89 | 516060040-2 | SOLD | \$499.45 |
| 90 | 519390009-6 | SOLD | \$2,746.70 |

COUNTY OF RIVERSIDE
OFFICE OF THE TREASURER-TAX COLLECTOR
SALE OF TAX DEFAULTED PROPERTY - TC211
NOVEMBER 29, 2017

| <u>ITEM#</u> | <u>ASSESSMENT#</u> | <u>STATUS</u> | <u>SALE PRICE</u> |
|--------------|--------------------|---------------|-------------------|
| 91 | 520030012-5 | SOLD | \$274.45 |
| 92 | 520070005-3 | SOLD | \$2,497.25 |
| 93 | 520070007-5 | SOLD | \$623.90 |
| 94 | 528171003-9 | SOLD | \$358.00 |
| 95 | 528223007-3 | SOLD | \$1,725.02 |
| 96 | 528223008-4 | SOLD | \$1,725.02 |
| 97 | 528223009-5 | SOLD | \$1,725.02 |
| 98 | 529050035-1 | SOLD | \$790.00 |
| 99 | 529150007-5 | SOLD | \$3,603.52 |
| 100 | 540032015-0 | SOLD | \$748.90 |
| 101 | 540063039-8 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 102 | 545107026-6 | SOLD | \$499.45 |
| 103 | 555270019-8 | SOLD | \$2,751.00 |
| 104 | 567170015-2 | SOLD | \$1,250.00 |
| 105 | 569280004-6 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 106 | 577120015-0 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 107 | 600051020-2 | SOLD | \$2,502.20 |
| 108 | 603200032-4 | SOLD | \$249.95 |
| 109 | 638400001-8 | SOLD | \$1,500.00 |
| 110 | 644270038-6 | NO BID | |
| 111 | 645350011-5 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 112 | 654260001-4 | SOLD | \$10,249.65 |
| 113 | 654270023-5 | REDEEMED | |
| 114 | 656440018-0 | NO BID | |
| 115 | 657351034-6 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 116 | 664060015-2 | SOLD | \$1,123.35 |
| 117 | 664110030-9 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 118 | 666350011-8 | SOLD | \$10,249.45 |
| 119 | 667090001-3 | SOLD | \$503.58 |
| 120 | 673131002-5 | REDEEMED | |
| 121 | 694231018-2 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 122 | 697230025-6 | REDEEMED | |
| 123 | 707352001-5 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 124 | 715260010-8 | SOLD | \$10,272.55 |
| 125 | 717050005-9 | SOLD | \$274.45 |
| 126 | 721120004-5 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 127 | 723190002-4 | REDEEMED | |
| 128 | 750030014-8 | SOLD | \$249.45 |
| 129 | 750260012-7 | SOLD | \$60,000.00 |
| 130 | 750350005-9 | REDEEMED | |
| 131 | 957130003-8 | SOLD | \$10,099.56 |
| 132 | 964170010-0 | SOLD | \$249.45 |